

CCSDJPC - Fuel Bid

Bid 2324-6	MANSFIELD OIL CO.	PETROLEUM TRADERS	Suburban Propane
	Gainesville, GA	Fort Wayne, IN	Exton, PA
	Non Coll / RC / Bond/ Cost Sav	Non Coll / RC / Bond/ Cost Sav	Non Coll / RC / Bond/ Cost Sav
	YES	YES	YES
# 2 Heating Oil	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total
Option 1 - FLOATING <7000	No Bid	.4336 / 3.2125	.40 / 3.4096
>7000	No Bid	.0259 / 2.8048	.40 / 3.4096
Option 2 - FIRM <7000	No Bid	.5629 / 3.1761	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	.1633 / 2.7765	NO BID
	Adjustment	Adjustment	Adjustment
Option 3 <7000	No Bid	0.5629	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	0.1633	NO BID
Option 4 -Price per Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID
2% Bio ULSD	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total
Option 1 - FLOATING <7000	.3427 / 3.2951	.3227 / 3.3016	NO BID
>7000	.0597 / 3.0122	.0469 / 3.0258	NO BID
Option 2 - FIRM <7000	No Bid	.5627 / 3.1672	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	.2728 / 2.8773	NO BID
	Adjustment	Adjustment	Adjustment
Option 3 <7000	0.5297	0.5627	NO BID
>7000	0.3367	0.2728	NO BID
Additional Pricing B5 <7000	No Bid	0.0200	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	0.0200	NO BID
B10 <7000	No Bid	0.0450	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	0.0450	NO BID
B20 <7000	No Bid	0.0800	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	0.0800	NO BID

CCSDJPC - Fuel Bid

ULSD, Dyed	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total
Option 1 - FLOATING <7000	No Bid	.8500 / 3.8370	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID
Option 2 - FIRM <7000	No Bid	1.4422 / 4.0467	NO BID
>7000	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID
	Adjustment	Adjustment	Adjustment
Option 3 <7000	No Bid	1.4422	0.4386
>7000	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID
Unleaded Gas	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total
Option 1 - FLOATING <2500	.3832 / 2.7395	.3166 / 2.6748	NO BID
>2500	.2571 / 2.6134	.0770 / 2.4352	NO BID
Option 2 - FIRM <2500	No Bid	.3593 / 2.6752	NO BID
>2500	No Bid	.1281 / 2.4440	NO BID
	Adjustment	Adjustment	Adjustment
Option 3 <2500	0.4053	0.3593	NO BID
>2500	0.2578	0.1281	NO BID
Unleaded Plus Gas	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total	Adjustment / Net Total
Option 1 - FLOATING <2500	No Bid	.2802 / 2.8548	NO BID
>2500	No Bid	.0566 / 2.6312	NO BID
Option 2 - FIRM <2500	No Bid	.4305 / 2.7464	NO BID
>2500	No Bid	.2149 / 2.5308	NO BID
	Adjustment	Adjustment	Adjustment
Option 3 <2500	No Bid	0.4305	NO BID
>2500	No Bid	0.2149	NO BID